
 

 A NOTE FROM THE ACTIVITIES 
COMMITTEE 

Activities happen only when someone 
volunteers to host an event. Remember, the 
entire group will be there to help you, so don’t be 
shy! Please volunteer … we need you to keep 
the activities alive! 

ONGOING ACTIVITIES 

WEDNESDAY COFFEE & DONUTS - 9 am 
Current host: Carol Jenkins 

POKENO - Wednesday at 7 pm. Host: Charlie 
Jenkins 

FRIDAY POT LUCK & BBQ - Social hour 5-6 
pm, dinner 6:30 pm. Bring your meat to BBQ 
and a side dish to share. Card Bingo  at 7 after 
potluck and BBQ. 

OTHER SPECIAL ACTIVITIES 
HELD EACH WEEK: 

LADIES MONDAY LUNCH - Meet at the Club 
House at 11 am to car pool to predetermined 
restaurants. 

WATER AEROBICS - Monday, Wednesday, & 
Friday - 9 to 10 am.  

GREEN THUMBS – Tuesdays, meet at 
clubhouse at 9 am 
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SPANISH LESSONS – Tuesdays at 1 pm 

BEADING – Thursdays at 7 pm at the 
Clubhouse 

DATES TO REMEMBER 

AUGUST 3 – No BBQ; Pre Garage Sale night. 
Hamburgers and hot dogs with potato salad will 
be at the clubhouse for $3.00, so no one has to 
cook. The time will be earlier than normal: 
Starting at 4:30 pm until 6 pm 

AUGUST 4 – Garage Sale Day 9-4 pm 

AUGUST 4 – Wine Tasting in the office. Bring a 
snack to share and a bottle of wine for tasting. 

AUGUST 11 – Activities Meeting at 10 am 

AUGUST 18 – Chili Poker Run. Host: Barbara 
and Don Schleuse 

SEPTEMBER 1 – Mid New Year’s Eve 50’s 
Party. Hosts: Leslie and Roy Kryger 

SEPTEMBER 8 – Mother Hubbard’s (Low 
income) Dinner to raise money for the Food 
Bank. A $10 donation is requested. Host: Joene 
Olson. 

PLEASE NOTE: Check the bulletin boards 
located in various common buildings, main 
room, etc., for further information on the 
activities. 
 

 
 

 


